CITY OF CRAIG

ROAD & BRIDGE

Memo

To: City Council
Peter Brixius, City Manager

From: Randy Call, Public Works Director

Date:  March 27, 2019

Subject: Award of 1 Ton Pickup with Single Cab Single Wheel 4x4 w/ factory
8’ bed.

Bids were opened on March 5, 2019 for a 1 Ton PU w/Single Cab single wheel
4 x 4 w/ 8 bed. The 1 ton pickup will replace a 2009 Ford F350 4 x 4 w/
Tommy Lift gate (1-21) for the R & B department.

We sent out 4 bids and received back 2 bids one from Victory Motors in
the amount of $23,295.00 and one from Cook Ford in the amount of
$25,697.00 Please see the enclosed Vehicle Tab Sheet for the details on the
bid information.

We would like to recommend that the City of Craig purchase the 1 ton pickup
from Victory Motors for a total amount of $23,295.00

If you have any questions or concerns, please feel free to contact me at
824-4463.



1 Ton Pickup w/ Single Cab single wheel 4x4 Factory 8 ft. bed

Make & Warranty Delivery | Specifications | Price Ext Trade In | Total Price
Model Warranty
Victory 2018 Ram 5 yr./100,000 In Stock | MEETS $28,600.00 | $3,295.00 $8,600.00 | $23,295.00
Motors |3°00
regular cab | Ext. Warranty
4x4 5 yr./100,000
(bumper to
bumper)
Cook 2019 Ford 5 yr./60,000 130 days | MEETS $31,677.00 | $1,520.00 $7,500.00 | $25,697.00
Ford F-350 Reg
Inc Cab 8 box | Ext Warranty:
* 5 yr./60,000
Premium Care
Cook Chevy | NO BID
cenersl | Nowp
Fleet NO BID




CITY OF CRAIG

ROAD & BRIDGE

Memo

To: City Council

Peter Brixius, City Manager
From: Randy Call, Public Works Director
Date: March 26, 2019
Subject: Award of Portable Air Compressor

Bids were opened on March 5, 2019 for a Portable Air Compressor. The new
Air Compressor will replace a 2001 Air Compressor (1-55) for the R & B
department.

We sent out 7 bids and received back 3 bids two from Faris Machinery in the
amount of $15,990.00 and $19.460.00 and one from Century Equipment in
the amount of $26,000.00. Please see the enclosed Portable Air Compressor
Tab Sheet for the details on the bid information.

We would like to recommend that the City of Craig purchase the Portable Air
Compressor from Faris Machinery for a total amount of $15,990.00

If you have any questions or concerns, please feel free to contact me at
824-4463.



PORTABLE AIR COMPRESSOR

Make & Warranty Delivery | Specifications | Price TradeIn | Total
Model Price
Faris Doosen 1 yr./2000hours 45-60 days | MEETS $19.990.00 -$4,000.00 $15,990.00
- C185WDO material &
Machinery (material &
workmanship)
2yrs/4000 hrs.
(engine,tires,battery)
Faris Doosen 1 yr. /2000 hrs. 45-60 Days | MEETS $23,460.00 | -$4,000.00 | $19,460.00
- P185WDO material &
Machinery (material &
workmanship)
2 yrs. /4000 hrs.
(engine,tires,battery)
Century 2018 Sullair | 1 yr Full Machine 30days | MEETS $30,000.00 | -$4,000.00 | $26,000.00
- 185
Equpment 5yr /10,000 hr.
Air end warranty
Power Motive | NOBID
Wagner Equip. | No BID
United No BID
R‘?"tats NO BID
River en(’i NO BID
Severson’s

Supply




CITY OF CRAIG

ROAD & BRIDGE

Memo

To: City Council
Peter Brixius, City Manager
From: Randy Call, Public Works Director
Date:  March 27, 2019
Subject: Award 1 Ton Single Cab & Chassis with Dual Rear Wheels

Bids were opened on March 5, 2019 for a 1 Ton Single Cab & Chassis with
Dual Rear Wheels. The 1 ton pickup will replace a 2008 Ford F350 Flatbed
(1-16) 8’2 Boss Power V Snow Plow for the R & B department.

We sent out 4 bids and received back 2 bids one from Cook Ford in the
amount of $20,632.00 and one from Victory Motors in the amount of
$22.495.00 Please see the enclosed Vehicle Tab Sheet for the details on the
bid information.

We would like to recommend that the City of Craig purchase the 1 Ton Single
Cab & Chassis Pickup from Cook Ford for a total amount of $20,632.00

If you have any questions or concerns, please feel free to contact me at
824-4463.



1 Ton Single Cab & Chassis with Dual Rear Wheels

Make & | Warranty Delivery | Specifications | Price Ext Trade In Total Price

Model Warranty
CO0OK 2019 Ford | 3yr./36,000 140 days | MEETS $33,167.00 | $2,465.00 |-$S15,000.00 | $20,632.00
FORD F-350 Reg | 5yr./60,000

Cab Dually | Ext. Warranty

Cab & 5 yr./50,000

Chassis
Victory 2019 Ram | 3yr./36,000 90-120 | MEETS $35,200.00 | $3,795.00 |-$16,500.00 | $22,495.00
Motors 3500 Reg | 5yr./100,000 days

Cab & Ext. Warranty

Chassis 5yr./100,000

4x4

Cook Chevy- NO BID

General Motors Fleet — NO BID




CITY OF CRAIG

ROAD & BRIDGE

Memo

To: City Council
Peter Brixius, City Manager
From: Randy Call, Public Works Director
Date:  March 26, 2019
Subject: Award of Flatbed with Hoist for a 1Ton Cab & Chassis

Bids were opened on March 5, 2019 for a Flatbed with Hoist for a 1Ton Cab
& Chassis for the Road & Bridge department.

We sent out 7 bids and received back 2 bids one from Victory Motors in the
amount of $14,205.00 and one from Kois Brothers in the amount of
$8.872.00. Please see the enclosed Vehicle Tab Sheet for the details on the
bid information.

We would like to recommend that the City of Craig purchase the Flatbed with
Hoist for the 1 Ton Cab & Chassis from Kois Brothers for a total amount of
$8,872.00.

If you have any questions or concerns, please feel free to contact me at
824-4463.



Flatbed with Hoist for a 1Ton Cab & Chassis

Make & Warranty | Delivery | Specifications | Price Ext Total Price
Model Warranty
Kois KOIS MFG 7 yr. limited 60-90 MEETS $8,872.00 $8,872.00
Brothers BED warranty DAYS
STRUCTURAL | (hoist,
CHANNEL cylinder)
Vj_ctory FLATBED 90-120 | MEETS $14,205.00 $14,205.00
Motors HOIST DAYS
Auto Truck | NOBID
0.J. NO BID
\I:’I\latson NO BID
axey
Truck NO BID
McDonald
Auto Parts | NOBID

of Craig




CITY OF CRAIG
ROAD & BRIDGE

Memo

To: City Council
Peter Brixius, City Manager
From: Randy Call, Public Works Director
Date:  March 26, 2019
Subject: Award of Three Wheel Broom Street Sweeper with Belt Conveyor

Bids were opened on March 5, 2019 for a Three Wheel Broom
Street Sweeper with Belt Conveyor. The Sweeper will replace a
1999 Elgin Pelican Sweeper for the R & B department.

We sent out 3 bid packets and we received 1 bid back from Faris
Machinery Co. in the amount of $237,684.00. Please see the
enclosed Tab Sheet for the details on the bid information.

This Sweeper is over budget by $32,684.00 but with all the
equipment we will be purchasing this year the vehicle and
equipment line item will still be under budget.

We would like to recommend that the City of Craig purchase the
Three Wheel Broom Street Sweeper with Belt Conveyor from Faris
Machinery Co. for the amount of $237,684.00

If you have any questions or concerns, please feel free to contact
me at 824-4463.



Three Wheel Broom Street Sweeper w/Belt Conveyor

Make
&

Model | Warranty | Delivery | Specifications | Price Trade In Total Price
Faris 2019 1 year 91-120 days | MEETS $248,184.00 | -$10,500.00 | $237,684.00
Machinery Elgin warranty

Pelican
Hardline |NOBDD
Equipment
MacDonald | NOBID

Equipment
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